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AI-rhdsk058-02 $1.76
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Product Images

Short Description

Recycling 'Plant-A-Seed' Bookmark 3" x 8" Initial Set up cost 45$ for new custom artwork An environmentally
responsible product! By using 100% re-cycled cotton scraps to make our paper, we’re helping to conserve the
world’s forests. No trees are cut down to produce this fine linen seed-filled paper! Hand made, the paper
dissolves into soil as the flowers grow and can be planted year round indoors. Unlike hard to grow
wildflowers, we use flower seeds that will sprout in a week or less, and produce beautiful blooms in no time!
When sending a message of recycling and waste awareness amongst your employees‚ staff‚ students or
personnel‚ it's key that the message be followed up with reinforcing motivators. Amongst these motivators
are hundreds of recycling-related items that will capture attention‚ reinforce your goals and inform your
audience. We have a large variety of pens‚ mousepads‚ notepads‚ mugs‚ key rings‚ t-shirts‚ stress balls‚
magnets‚ info wheels and more that convey your message with class and clarity. Don't see what you need?
Call us for ideas! Remember‚ our point is getting yours across!

Description

Recycling 'Plant-A-Seed' Bookmark 3" x 8" Initial Set up cost 45$ for new custom artwork An environmentally
responsible product! By using 100% re-cycled cotton scraps to make our paper, we’re helping to conserve the
world’s forests. No trees are cut down to produce this fine linen seed-filled paper! Hand made, the paper
dissolves into soil as the flowers grow and can be planted year round indoors. Unlike hard to grow
wildflowers, we use flower seeds that will sprout in a week or less, and produce beautiful blooms in no time!
When sending a message of recycling and waste awareness amongst your employees‚ staff‚ students or
personnel‚ it's key that the message be followed up with reinforcing motivators. Amongst these motivators
are hundreds of recycling-related items that will capture attention‚ reinforce your goals and inform your
audience. We have a large variety of pens‚ mousepads‚ notepads‚ mugs‚ key rings‚ t-shirts‚ stress balls‚
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magnets‚ info wheels and more that convey your message with class and clarity. Don't see what you need?
Call us for ideas! Remember‚ our point is getting yours across!
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